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Lexie Trevena buried her murdered husband, discovered he had cheated on her, and signed to adopt his
newborn son—all before noon. Now she just wants to raise her child in the loving, supportive home she
never had. The last thing she needs is another man to complicate her life, but her best friends feel differently.
Their matchmaking meddling accidentally places Lexie smack in the path of a terrorist who intends to use
her as his pawn.

The only person who can help her is the FBI agent she holds responsible for her husband’s death.

Special-Agent-In-Charge Luke “Mac” McNeil watched his best friend and partner marry a woman he knew
was too good for him, but he did nothing to stop the wedding. He stood by as Lexie adopted the cheating
jerk’s son. But when someone goes to great lengths to make it appear that Lexie is responsible for launching
a drone into the home of a prominent Texas senator, Mac’s conscience finally speaks up, and he fights for
Lexie’s freedom . . . even though all the evidence leads to her door, and she has never given him a reason to
trust her.

Can Lexie and Mac find the courage to forgive and trust, or will their pride stand in the way of love,
allowing terrorists to bring another devastating attack onto United States soil?

Sensuality Level: Sensual
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From reader reviews:

William Perez:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled In the Shadow of Pride. Try to make book In the Shadow of Pride as your
friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you experience alone and beside that course make
you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you much more
confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let me make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Shannon Batiste:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this book. This In the Shadow of Pride is simple
bringing you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to
bring typically the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can
save often the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one
buys this book.

David Cain:

This In the Shadow of Pride is brand-new way for you who has interest to look for some information as it
relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who
still having small amount of digest in reading this In the Shadow of Pride can be the light food to suit your
needs because the information inside this book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books develop itself in
the form which is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in
reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is no in reading a publication
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the item! Just
read this e-book type for your better life and also knowledge.

Stella Carpenter:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source in which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you
actually. From media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference
book, story and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open
your book? Or just trying to find the In the Shadow of Pride when you essential it?
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