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Canada's "no. 1 defender of freedom of speech" and the bestselling author of Shakedown makes the
timely and provocative case that when it comes to oil, ethics matter just as much as the economy and
the environment.

In 2009, Ezra Levant's bestselling book Shakedown revealed the corruption of Canada's human rights
commissions and was declared the "most important public affairs book of the year." In Ethical Oil, Levant
turns his attention to another hot-button topic: the ethical cost of our addiction to oil. While many North
Americans may be aware of the financial and environmental price we pay for a gallon of gas or a barrel of
oil, Levant argues that it is time we consider ethical factors as well. With his trademark candor, Levant asks
hard-hitting questions: With the oil sands at our disposal, is it ethically responsible to import our oil from the
Sudan, Russia, and Mexico? How should we weigh carbon emissions with human rights violations in Saudi
Arabia? And assuming that we can't live without oil, can the development of energy be made more
environmentally sustainable? In Ethical Oil, Levant exposes the hypocrisy of the West's dealings with the
reprehensible regimes from which we purchase the oil that sustains our lifestyles, and offers solutions to this
dilemma. Readers at all points on the political spectrum will want to read this timely and provocative new
book, which is sure to spark debate.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Powers:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or data even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era which is always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to anyone is you don't know which you should start with. This Ethical Oil: The Case for
Canada's Oil Sands is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Nathan Wilson:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them household or their
friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
some sort of book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can
spent all day every day to reading a book. The book Ethical Oil: The Case for Canada's Oil Sands it is
extremely good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These were enjoying reading
this book. Should you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can
m0ore simply to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book has
high quality.

Connie Deroche:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its deal with may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer might be Ethical Oil: The Case for Canada's Oil Sands why because
the great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up
this book.

Kenneth Grimes:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This publication Ethical Oil: The Case for Canada's Oil Sands was filled about science.
Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has various
feel when they reading the book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can really feel enjoy to
read a publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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