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Much work over the last two decades has firmly established that loss of cell cycle checkpoint regulation, and
resultant unabated cellular proliferation, is an inherent characteristic of cancer. This loss may occur through
aberration in any single component involved in signal transduction pathways that orchestrate checkpoint
regulation, which may manifest through either a failure to activate the checkpoint or a failure to respond to
the activated checkpoint. In normal cells, checkpoint pathways are activated when genetic or cellular
homeostasis is compromised, and signals are then transduced to re-stabilize homeostasis, and, failing this, to
activate the apoptotic machinery to induce a cellular suicidal response. This implies that both survival and
cell death pathways are induced following checkpoint activation, and that the final decision is dependant on
the net result of integrating the two sets of signals.

It is intriguing that checkpoint pathways are also critical in cancer therapy to provide an apoptotic stimulus
when cellular damage induced by the therapeutic agent is detected by the sensor system. Therefore, it is not
surprising that failure in pro-survival checkpoint response will render tumor cells hypersensitive to
cytotoxics and, conversely, failure in pro-apoptotic checkpoint response will induce genetic instability and/or
therapeutic resistance. Understanding the intricacies of checkpoint response is, therefore, central to the
design of therapeutic regimen that will enhance antitumor effects. Although early versions of this design
entail combination of cytotoxic agents with cell cycle or checkpoint inhibitors, a greater understanding of the
concepts could make such combinations clinically more effective. The contributions in this book will
consolidate the current state of knowledge on checkpoint responses that may lay the foundation for
hypothesis-driven rational approaches in advancing the management of cancer.

The immediate attraction of the book to the scientific community is that it represents a timely opportunity to
build upon existing concepts of checkpoints to expand our understanding of the inner workings of the critical
checkpoint machinery. The present understanding has provided ample appreciation that response to
checkpoint activation is manifested through coordinated inhibition of cyclin-dependent kinase (CDK)
complexes in G1, S and/or the G2 phase in order to arrest the cell cycle. Kinase inhibition can occur through
several mechanisms, including inhibitory phosphorylation of CDK, destruction of the cognate cyclins, and
recruitment of CDK inhibitors from the INK and WAF1/CIP1 families. However, the wealth of information
from recent discoveries needs to be examined critically to consolidate our conceptual knowledge of
checkpoints. At the same time, there is acute awareness in the diversity of checkpoint response between
cytotoxic agents, and this serves as a reminder of the magnitude of complexity that is inherent in checkpoint
regulation. This volume is intended to bring the cancer research community closer toward an improved
understanding of this regulation, how checkpoint abnormalities can impact negatively on cancer therapy, and



emerging strategies to target checkpoint response as a therapeutic end-point.
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From reader reviews:

Maria Vanness:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in
the world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Checkpoint Controls and
Targets in Cancer Therapy (Cancer Drug Discovery and Development). All type of book is it possible to see
on many solutions. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Rosemary Till:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you studying a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
Checkpoint Controls and Targets in Cancer Therapy (Cancer Drug Discovery and Development), you could
tells your family, friends along with soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make
them reading a e-book.

Richard Daniels:

The reason? Because this Checkpoint Controls and Targets in Cancer Therapy (Cancer Drug Discovery and
Development) is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap the item but latter
it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write
the book in such remarkable way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining approach
but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you
going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book have such as help
improving your proficiency and your critical thinking method. So , still want to postpone having that book?
If I were you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Sandra Black:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not trying Checkpoint Controls and Targets
in Cancer Therapy (Cancer Drug Discovery and Development) that give your entertainment preference will
be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the method for
people to know world better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be stated constantly
that reading behavior only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person.



So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit, you may pick Checkpoint Controls and Targets
in Cancer Therapy (Cancer Drug Discovery and Development) become your starter.
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