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“Compelling, timely, and provocative. The writing is sleek and exhilarating. It doesn’t waste time telling us
what it will do or what it has just done—it just does it.”

—Don Kulick, Professor of Anthropology, New York University

How we can talk about sex and risk in the age of barebacking—or condomless sex—without invoking the
usual bogus and punitive clichés about gay men’s alleged low self-esteem, lack of self-control, and other
psychological “deficits”? Are there queer alternatives to psychology for thinking about the inner life of
homosexuality? What Do Gay Men Want? explores some of the possibilities.

Unlike most writers on the topic of gay men and risky sex, David Halperin liberates gay male subjectivity
from psychology, demonstrating the insidious ways in which psychology’s defining opposition between the
normal and the pathological subjects homosexuality to medical reasoning and revives a whole set of 
unexamined moral assumptions about “good” sex and “bad” sex.

In particular, Halperin champions neglected traditions of queer thought, including both literary and popular
discourses, by drawing on the work of well-known figures like Jean Genet and neglected ones like Marcel
Jouhandeau. He shows how the long history of of gay men’s uses of “abjection” can offer an alternative,
nonmoralistic model for thinking about gay male subjectivity, something which is urgently needed in the age
of barebacking.

Anyone searching for nondisciplinary ways to slow the spread of HIV/AIDS among gay men—or interested
in new modes of thinking about gay male subjectivity—should read this book.

David M. Halperin is W. H. Auden Collegiate Professor of the History and Theory of Sexuality, Professor of
English, Professor of Women’s Studies, Professor of Comparative Literature, and Adjunct Professor of
Classical Studies at the University of Michigan.
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From reader reviews:

Cameron Keller:

The book What Do Gay Men Want?: An Essay on Sex, Risk, and Subjectivity can give more knowledge and
also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the great thing like a
book What Do Gay Men Want?: An Essay on Sex, Risk, and Subjectivity? A number of you have a different
opinion about guide. But one aim which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now,
try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you could give for each
other; you can share all of these. Book What Do Gay Men Want?: An Essay on Sex, Risk, and Subjectivity
has simple shape however, you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can look the enormous
world by available and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Donna Sedillo:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just
watching TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look
different you can read any book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent the entire day to reading a reserve. The book What Do Gay Men Want?: An Essay on Sex, Risk, and
Subjectivity it is rather good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These were
enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the
actual e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not to fund
but this book possesses high quality.

Pablo Cook:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, brief story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not trying What Do Gay Men Want?: An
Essay on Sex, Risk, and Subjectivity that give your fun preference will be satisfied by reading this book.
Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world a great deal better
then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading practice only
for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for every you
who want to start studying as your good habit, you can pick What Do Gay Men Want?: An Essay on Sex,
Risk, and Subjectivity become your personal starter.

Rodolfo Buker:

In this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should do
is just spending your time little but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of many books in the top
list in your reading list is What Do Gay Men Want?: An Essay on Sex, Risk, and Subjectivity. This book and



that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up and
review this book you can get many advantages.
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