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With accuracy, wit, and intelligence, this remarkable new translation of The Golden Ass breathes new life
into Apuleius's classic work. Sarah Ruden, a lyric poet as well as a highly respected translator, skillfully
duplicates the verbal high jinks of Apuleius's ever-popular novel. It tells the story of Lucius, a curious and
silly young man, who is turned into a donkey when he meddles with witchcraft. Doomed to wander from
region to region and mistreated by a series of deplorable owners, Lucius at last is restored to human form
with the help of the goddess Isis.

The Golden Ass, the first Latin novel to survive in its entirety, is related to the Second Sophistic, a movement
of learned and inventive literature. In a translation that is both the most faithful and the most entertaining to
date, Ruden reveals to modern readers the vivid, farcical ingenuity of Apuleius's style.
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From reader reviews:

Rafael Runyan:

In other case, little people like to read book The Golden Ass. You can choose the best book if you like
reading a book. Providing we know about how is important a new book The Golden Ass. You can add
understanding and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, because from book you
can recognize everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple
factor until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we could open a book or searching by internet
device. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's read.

Velma Stuart:

Here thing why this particular The Golden Ass are different and reliable to be yours. First of all looking at a
book is good but it depends in the content than it which is the content is as tasty as food or not. The Golden
Ass giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no
guide that similar with The Golden Ass. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your personal eyes
about the thing that will happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. You can
actually bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your approach home by train. When you are having
difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of The Golden Ass in e-book can be your alternative.

Stephen Bruns:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its deal with may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer could be The Golden Ass why because the great cover that make you consider
about the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or
perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Arlene Wilson:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen need book to know the change information of year to be able to year. As we know those ebooks have
many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. By the
book The Golden Ass we can consider more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To become
creative person must love to read a book. Simply choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't
possibly be doubt to change your life with that book The Golden Ass. You can more pleasing than now.
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