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Herr Norbert Hanning’s wartime career makes for fascinating and highly informative reading on an aspect of
the 1939-45 air war not often covered in the English language; primarily that of the campaign against the
Soviet Union.

He was one of the midwar-generation Luftwaffe fighter pilots and began operations with JG 54 on the
eastern (Leningrad) front in early 1943; initially flying Messerschmitt Bf 109s before transitioning to the
Focke-Wulf Fw 190. He became a Staffel CO and was credited with 42 victories, also serving with JV 44
(whose CO was Adolf Galland); he then returned to Germany towards the closing stages of the war to
convert to Me 262 jet fighters.

Many and varied were his experiences in action against the rejuvenated Soviet Air Force in the east, and the
powerful western Allies over the homeland during the final chaotic months of hostilities, which culminated
in his captivity.

John Weal’s skilful translation ensures that the fluid and descriptive style of the author is preserved.
Thankfully, also, Norbert was a keen photographer who shot a profusion of images, all previously
unpublished, many of which appear in this important book.
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From reader reviews:

Jesse Nance:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book Luftwaffe Fighter Ace. You can choose the best book
if you'd prefer reading a book. As long as we know about how is important the book Luftwaffe Fighter Ace.
You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from
book you can understand everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About
simple factor until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or
maybe searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel uninterested to go to
the library. Let's examine.

Floretta Simmons:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and
the resources within it can be true or not need people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to
be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Examining a book
can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Luftwaffe Fighter Ace book since this book
offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no
doubt in it as you know.

Morris Sampson:

This book untitled Luftwaffe Fighter Ace to be one of several books this best seller in this year, this is
because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this specific
book in the book retail store or you can order it by using online. The publisher with this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So
there is no reason for you to past this guide from your list.

Ricardo Huddle:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, magazine,
book, and soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to you is Luftwaffe Fighter Ace this e-book consist a lot of the information with the condition
of this world now. That book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles
that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some exploration when he
makes this book. This is why this book ideal all of you.
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