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"The ultimate lesbian love novel."—The Lesbian News

"A masterpiece of lesbian love."—The Sacramento Star

The intimacy of a cabin at Lake Tahoe provides the combustible setting that brings Diana Holland and Lane
Christianson together in this passionate novel of first discovery. Candid in its eroticism, intensely romantic,
and remarkably beautiful, Curious Wine is a love story that will remain in your memory.

Katherine Forrest is the author of 12 books, including the groundbreaking science-fiction novel Daughters
of a Coral Dawn and the enduringly popular Kate Delafield Mysteries. She lives in San Francisco.
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From reader reviews:

Rosa Reid:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Curious Wine. Try to make the book Curious Wine as your
buddy. It means that it can being your friend when you really feel alone and beside associated with course
make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you a lot
more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , let me make new experience and
also knowledge with this book.

Katrina Scofield:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, small story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not seeking Curious Wine that give your
pleasure preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can
be said as the means for people to know world much better then how they react when it comes to the world.
It can't be mentioned constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky individual but for all of you who
wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good habit, you can
pick Curious Wine become your starter.

Regina Schubert:

You can spend your free time to study this book this book. This Curious Wine is simple to develop you can
read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not include much space to bring
typically the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save
typically the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one
buys this book.

Brad Sharpe:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source that will filled update
of news. With this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just trying to find the Curious Wine when you essential it?
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