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If the U.S. economy is booming, why are so many Americans struggling to get by? Steve Brouwer answers
this and many other questions in Sharing the Pie, an informative and irreverent critique of the rightward shift
in America since 1980. Brouwer draws upon a wealth of statistics to chart the disastrous economic and social
consequences of the Reagan and Bush years, and documents Bill Clinton's failure to reverse the steady
decline in the living standards of most Americans.

Using concise, easy-to-understand charts and graphs presented in an oversized format, Sharing the Pie
punctures some of the most pervasive myths about our economy: that our foreign competitors are to blame
for our current malaise; that we "can't afford" a government that provides decent education, health care, and
social services; and that a "rising tide" (i.e., a surging stock market and unbridled corporate greed) will "lift
all boats."

An invaluable resource for those who want to make sense of the economy, Sharing the Pie is also a
passionate plea for greater economic equality and a revitalization of American democracy.
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From reader reviews:

Candice Delgado:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can understand everything you want by
a book. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Sharing the Pie : A Citizen's Guide to Wealth
and Power will make you to always be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about
anything. But some of you think that will open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is far from
make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or acceptable book with
you?

Brian Rocha:

This book untitled Sharing the Pie : A Citizen's Guide to Wealth and Power to be one of several books which
best seller in this year, that's because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will
easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by using online. The publisher of
the book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your
Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this reserve from your list.

Micah Clark:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its include may
doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic
as in the outside look likes. Maybe you answer could be Sharing the Pie : A Citizen's Guide to Wealth and
Power why because the great cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint
you actually. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth
sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Melissa Broussard:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find reserve that
need more time to be examine. Sharing the Pie : A Citizen's Guide to Wealth and Power can be your answer
mainly because it can be read by anyone who have those short extra time problems.
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