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Whilst many books have been written on the history of the Parachute Regiment and Airborne Forces in the
Second World War, none of them have concentrated solely on the story of the 1st Parachute Brigade in North
Africa between 1942 and 1943.

'Tunisian Tales' covers the raising of the Brigade in 1941 and training in the UK before their transfer to the
Mediterranean theater of operations. It also covers the three airborne operations carried out by the Brigade
there - Bone, Souk-el-Arba and Depienne/Oudna - in great detail.

The book is complemented by around 90 photos many never published before, several maps (including one
used by Lieutenant Colonel Pearson when in command of the 1st Parachute Battalion) and coverage of the
Airborne Medical Services in the area, besides extensive appendices.

This is Niall's third book for Helion following on from his highly successful previous titles - 'Most
Unfavourable Ground' and 'Striking Back'. As in his previous works, detailed research has been carried out
using official reports, war diaries and veterans' accounts. The book has the full approval of 'Airborne
Assault', the Museum of the Parachute Regiment and Airborne Forces at Duxford, and we are delighted that
its curator, Jon Baker, has contributed the Foreword.

'Tunisian Tales' represents a notable contribution to new research into the history of Britain's airborne forces.
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From reader reviews:

Heather Snyder:

The book Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 gives you the sense of being
enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable much more increase. Book can being your
best friend when you getting pressure or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make
studying a book Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 for being your habit,
you can get a lot more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all
subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open up and read a guide Tunisian Tales: The 1st
Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science publication or
encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Van Gee:

What do you regarding book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy particular
person? If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored
faster. And you have time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They need to
answer that question because just their can do that. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person.
Yes, it is correct. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this particular Tunisian Tales: The
1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 to read.

Walter Feuerstein:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43
book is readable simply by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for
enjoyable studying experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The
writer involving Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 content conveys the
thought easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it
just different available as it. So , do you still thinking Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North
Africa 1942-43 is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Christine Smith:

Beside this Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 in your phone, it can give
you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you can
got here is fresh through the oven so don't be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow small
town. It is good thing to have Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 because
this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you do not get
what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this within your hand. The



Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to
miss the idea? Find this book as well as read it from today!
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