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In the fourth and final volume of The Straits Quartet, Charlotte Macleod is the English concubine. Her love
affair with Zhen, wealthy Chinese merchant, is an open scandal to both the English and the Chinese
communities. Singapore in 1860 is a vice-ridden town filled 'with the dregs of humanity from two
continents'. Opium makes up half of the British Empire’s trade in the East and, from Singapore, the Chinese
triads control the vast distribution of chandu, refined opium, which is spread throughout the south seas. Turf
wars are fought on the high seas and on the streets of Chinatown to control the mighty profits of this trade.
The colonial government, impoverished and ineffectual, can do nothing about it. Only the Chinese godfather,
the lord of the kongsi, has that power through his control of the coolie, prostitute and opium trade. When
Zhen is forced to become the godfather of the kongsi, cracks appear in Charlotte’s world and when
Alexander, her son, unaware of his true paternity, arrives from Scotland and begins a secret and incestuous
affair with his own half sister, it explodes. Opium, murder, incest, suicide, passion and love. A heady
combination in the sin city of the south seas.
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From reader reviews:

Tom Scott:

The book The English Concubine: Passion and Power in 1860's Singapore (The Straits Quartet) gives you
the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable much more increase.
Book can to become your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem along with your subject.
If you can make reading a book The English Concubine: Passion and Power in 1860's Singapore (The Straits
Quartet) being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your own capable, increase
your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You may know everything if you like start and read a guide The
English Concubine: Passion and Power in 1860's Singapore (The Straits Quartet). Kinds of book are several.
It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this guide?

Jodi Harper:

Is it you who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The English Concubine: Passion and Power in
1860's Singapore (The Straits Quartet) can be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are
so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what
these ebooks have than the others?

Myrtle Galloway:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. That The English Concubine: Passion and Power in 1860's
Singapore (The Straits Quartet) can give you a lot of good friends because by you looking at this one book
you have matter that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one
of one step for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't
understand, by knowing more than various other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to
have The English Concubine: Passion and Power in 1860's Singapore (The Straits Quartet).

Vickie Duke:

A lot of book has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the top book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is referred to as of
book The English Concubine: Passion and Power in 1860's Singapore (The Straits Quartet). You can add
your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make
anyone happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from
one place to other place.
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