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Cayce Pollard é uma coolhunter. Suas habilidades como caçadora de tendências, aliadas a um quê de
profetisa e a uma inusitada alergia a marcas registradas, faz dela uma profissional disputada por corporações
do mundo inteiro. Chamada a Londres para uma nova oportunidade de trabalho, Cayce recebe uma proposta
ambiciosa e obscura: descobrir quem está por trás da criação e disseminação do "filme", uma coleção de
fragmentos de vídeo postados anonimamente na web e que atraem milhares de seguidores, inclusive ela
mesma.

Pivô de um jogo perigoso, Cayce correrá todos os riscos para atingir seu objetivo, lançando-se numa busca
frenética que envolve sabotadores industriais, hackers de primeira linha, chefes da máfia russa, fanboys da
internet e espiões aposentados. Reconhecimento de Padrões é um retrato brilhante da cultura de consumo e
de esoterismo pós-moderno. Com ele, William Gibson abre a Trilogia Blue Ant, um mosaico do século 21
que se desdobra nos livros Território Fantasma e História Zero.
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From reader reviews:

Natasha Rich:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Reconhecimento de Padrões (Trilogia Blue Ant) (Portuguese
Edition). Try to the actual book Reconhecimento de Padrões (Trilogia Blue Ant) (Portuguese Edition) as
your close friend. It means that it can being your friend when you experience alone and beside that course
make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you much
more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let's make new experience as well as
knowledge with this book.

Deborah Hart:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, small story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving Reconhecimento de Padrões
(Trilogia Blue Ant) (Portuguese Edition) that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied simply by
reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world a
great deal better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading
habit only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for
all of you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you are able to pick Reconhecimento de Padrões
(Trilogia Blue Ant) (Portuguese Edition) become your personal starter.

Antoinette Lefebre:

The book untitled Reconhecimento de Padrões (Trilogia Blue Ant) (Portuguese Edition) contain a lot of
information on that. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy method. The language is very easy to
understand all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous
author. The author provides you in the new age of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you
can continue reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site as well as order
it. Have a nice learn.

Donna Muniz:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you also
know that little person including reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update concerning something by
book. Many kinds of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually
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