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From Jennifer Donnelly, the critically acclaimed New York Times bestselling author of A Northern Light and
Revolution, comes a mystery about dark secrets, dirty truths, and the lengths to which people will go for love
and revenge. For fans of Elizabeth George and Libba Bray, These Shallow Graves is the story of how much a
young woman is willing to risk and lose in order to find the truth.
    Jo Montfort is beautiful and rich, and soon—like all the girls in her class—she’ll graduate from finishing
school and be married off to a wealthy bachelor. Which is the last thing she wants. Jo dreams of becoming a
writer—a newspaper reporter like the trailblazing Nellie Bly.
    Wild aspirations aside, Jo’s life seems perfect until tragedy strikes: her father is found dead. Charles
Montfort shot himself while cleaning his pistol. One of New York City’s wealthiest men, he owned a
newspaper and was a partner in a massive shipping firm, and Jo knows he was far too smart to clean a loaded
gun.
    The more Jo hears about her father’s death, the more something feels wrong. Suicide is the only logical
explanation, and of course people have started talking, but Jo’s father would never have resorted to that. And
then she meets Eddie—a young, smart, infuriatingly handsome reporter at her father’s newspaper—and it
becomes all too clear how much she stands to lose if she keeps searching for the truth. But now it might be
too late to stop.
    The past never stays buried forever. Life is dirtier than Jo Montfort could ever have imagined, and this
time the truth is the dirtiest part of all.

Praise for These Shallow Graves:

"These Shallow Graves delivered all that I adore: lovely prose, historical intrigue, unique characters and
setting. I devoured this book!"-Ruta Sepetys, New York Times bestselling author of Between Shades of Gray
and Out of the Easy

"An intelligent, personable heroine-Jo Montfort's hopes for an enlightened future uncover a dark past,
resulting in a splendidly hair-raising tour of the brightest and darkest corners of Victorian New York."-
Elizabeth Wein, New York Times bestselling author of Code Name Verity and Black Dove, White Raven

"A fast-paced Gilded Age crime thriller that plunges its intrepid investigative-journalist heroine into the
sordid underworld of nineteenth-century New York City and into her own family's dark secrets."-Julie Berry,
award-winning author of All the Truth That's In Me

"Jo Montfort is a gutsy modern heroine in a beguiling tale of old New York. Money, murder, betrayal,
and family secrets....I loved spending time in this world!"-Elizabeth Ross, author of William C. Morris
Award finalist Belle Epoque

[STAR] "Fast-paced and thrilling...a smart, insightful, timely depiction of a young woman poised on the
brink of a new world after the shattering of another."-Booklist, Starred

[STAR] "Action-packed chapters propel this compelling mystery...[and] the injustices Donnelly
highlights remain all too relevant."-Publishers Weekly, Starred



[STAR] "A riveting historical mystery-thriller...[that] succeeds as a wonderfully paced thriller, a heart-
pounding romance and an unflinching look at the hard choices one young woman must make when society
disparages her dreams."-Shelf Awareness, Starred

"A beautifully written mystery."-School Library Journal

"[A] fast-paced thriller...the story races to its surprising conclusion."-Kirkus Reviews

"A heroine you can't help cheering on."-The Horn Book

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Kim Bartlett:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't wish do
that. You must know how great along with important the book These Shallow Graves. All type of book
would you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Joseph Herbst:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book especially
book entitled These Shallow Graves your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every
single aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each word written
in a book then become one application form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get just
before. The These Shallow Graves giving you another experience more than blown away your head but also
giving you useful details for your better life within this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern
this is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a. Do
you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

James Haney:

This These Shallow Graves is fresh way for you who has attention to look for some information because it
relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you
who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this These Shallow Graves can be the light food for you
because the information inside that book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books create itself in the
form which can be reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in
book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this book is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a e-
book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't
miss the idea! Just read this e-book variety for your better life along with knowledge.

Bruce Sandlin:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or make
summary for some guide, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart and soul or real
their interest. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this These Shallow Graves can make you sense more interested to read.
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